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TOWN OF APPLE VALLEY 
TOWN COUNCIL STAFF REPORT 

 

To:  Honorable Mayor and Town Council  Date: January 24, 2017 
 
From:  Marc Puckett, Assistant Town Manager Item No:  6 
  
Subject: AMENDMENT TO THE FRANCHISE AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE 

TOWN OF APPLE VALLEY AND BURRTEC WASTE INDUSTRIES INC. 
 
T.M. Approval: _____________________  Budgeted Item:  Yes   No  N/A 

 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
 
That the Town Council approve the Amendment to the Exclusive Franchise Agreement 
between the Town of Apple Valley and Burrtec Waste Industries, Inc. amending the term 
of the agreement.   
 
SUMMARY: 
 
The Town entered into agreements for the provision of solid waste and recycling services 
with Burrtec Waste Industries, Inc. (Burrtec) on August 23, 1994. These agreements have 
been reviewed and modified periodically. The contractor has been providing solid waste 
services to the Town pursuant to the agreements. The agreements grant Burrtec the 
exclusive right and privilege to collect, transfer, transport, recycle, process and dispose 
of Solid Waste and Recyclable Material, exclusive of Construction Waste, Hazardous 
Waste and Special Waste accumulated within the Town limits.   

Per this amendment, the initial term of the amendment will commence upon execution of 
this agreement and will expire on January 1, 2027, thus extending the existing agreement 
by eight (8) years. Thereafter, and similar to the current agreement, this amended 
agreement is set to be automatically renewed for succeeding ten (10) year terms unless 
the Town finds Burrtec to be in breach of the agreement or if it is determined that Burrtec’s 
performance is unsatisfactory. Under the terms of the agreement, Burrtec is required to 
collect Solid Waste and Recyclable Materials at least once per week. In addition, once 
each spring and fall, Burrtec is required to  provide the Town with roll-off bins and other 
assistance as needed for community-wide cleanups at no additional cost. The Agreement 
further requires Burrtec to prepare an annual public education plan that will continue to 
inform the public how to correctly sort materials for recycling, the importance of diversion, 
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to publicize the operation and diversion accomplished by the Victor Valley Materials 
Recovery Facility (MRF), and the implementation of any new diversion programs such as 
organics collection. Burrtec also prepares and distributes public education materials to all 
Residential and Commercial Customers at least two (2) times during each Contract Year. 
All education materials are subject to the Town’s review and approval.  

The proposed amendment also maintains the existing waste hauling rate for one year.  
By maintaining the existing waste hauling rate, the Town will save approximately $60,000 
over the next year and a total of $600,000 over the term of the agreement.  All other terms 
of the existing agreement remain unchanged. The existing agreement and proposed 
amendment documents and sets forth the rights and responsibilities of each party during 
the contract term.     

Under the existing agreement, Burrtec may annually request adjustments to the charges 
made to Customers under this Agreement to reflect increases in their costs. The 
requested adjustments are based on the previous calendar year twelve (12) month 
average change in the Consumer Price Index for All Urban Consumers as published by 
the U.S. Department of Labor for Los Angeles-Riverside-Orange Counties. The Town 
may request additional information if the Town believes that the materials provided by 
Burrtec are insufficient or inadequate. No adjustment granted by the Town shall exceed 
four percent (4%) or the change in the Consumer Price Index for All Urban Consumers 
(“CPI-U”) published by the U.S. Department of Labor for the Los Angeles-Riverside-
Orange County statistical area, whichever is less. Burrtec may request an extraordinary 
adjustment due to extraordinary changes in service costs resulting from regulations 
imposed by Federal, State or local regulatory agencies, including additional diversion 
program requirements or other unforeseen service cost impacts.   For any such request 
Burrtec is required to prepare a schedule documenting the extraordinary costs prepared 
in a form acceptable to the Town with supporting documentation for any assumptions 
made. The Town will then review the request and Town Council will make the final 
determination as to whether any adjustment will be made.   

FISCAL ANALYSIS: 
 
The proposed amendment will maintain the existing waste hauling rate unchanged for 
one (1) year. By maintaining the existing waste hauling rate, the Town will save 
approximately $60,000 over the next year and a total of $600,000 over the term of the 
agreement.  
 
STAFF RECOMMENDATION: 
 
Staff recommends that the Town Council approve the attached proposed amendment to 
the Franchise Agreement between the Town of Apple Valley and Burrtec Waste 
Industries, Inc.  
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ATTACHMENT: 
 
Proposed Franchise Agreement with Amendments 
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